BOARD OF SUPERVISORS MADISON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI

Department of Engineering 3137 South Liberty Street, Canton, MS 39046
Tim Bryan, P.E., County Engineer Office (601) 790-2525 FAX (601) 859-3430

MEMORANDUM

November 3, 2020

To: Sheila Jones, Supervisor, District |
Trey Baxter, Supervisor, District I
Gerald Steen, Supervisor, District 111
Karl Banks, Supervisor, District IV
Paul Griffin, Supervisor, District V

From: Tim Bryan, P.E., PTOE
County Engineer

Re:  Request for Payment
Project: Bozeman Road Improvements
Parcel: 026-00-00-W

The Engineering Department recommends that the Board accept the invoice for $625.00 for the acquisition of

the right of way for Bozeman Road Improvements Project for Rosie C. Thomas and Ronny Barrett and to
authorize the Comptroller to issue the check.

Check payment to:

Payee: Price & Ziruinik, PLLC, IOLTA Foundation Trust Account
for Rosie C. Thomas and Ronny Barrett
750 Woodlands Parkway, Suite 205
Ridgeland, MS 39157

SHEILA JONES TREY BAXTER GERALD STEEN KARL BANKS PAUL GRIFFIN
District One District Two District Three District Four District Five



ROW-320 Madison County, Mississippi Page 1 of 1
Date Novermnbsr 3, 2020 INVOQICE - RIGHT OF WAY P.C. Number 941/ A
State Acquired By: Nature of Title
Vendor No. V000167 376-1 Customer Acct. No. NA
Agreement X Fes Simple X
Payes__ Price & Zrulnlk, PLLC, IOLTA Foundation Trust Account
Settiement Perm. Ease
for Rosie C. Thomas and Ronnhy Barrett _
Condemnation Temp, Ease
Special
Clreuit
Supreme 84-01
Mortgages Acqulsition
TN NG,
Address 750 Woodlands Parkway, Stite 205
Ridgeland, MS 39157
Neel-Schatfer Madison Parcel; 026-00-00-W
Project No,  LPPA 1068993-701000 County File No. Resle €. Thomas, et al
Pascription Amount
Partla! Release Fees - Quicken Loans, Inc, $ 625,00
IRS W.-9 Form signed 10-16-20
Bozeman Road Improvements
TOTAL INVOICE $ 825,00
Recommended For Payment Approved Pald By
Warrant No.
Madison Caunty, Mississippi Req. No.
By Date
Print Name
User Project/Detail
OCA Level | Code1 | Code 2 Property 1D Amount Parcel No. Acres
3 {Funcilon) {Part: Code Maint. See,




ADMINISTRATIVE ADJUSTMENT REQUEST

County: Madison

Project: LPA 106993-701000

Parcel: 026-00-00-W

Owner: Rosie C. Thomas and Ronny Barrett

This is a request to approve an administrative adjustment in the amount of $625.00

Justification:

Original Fair Market Value Offer:
$ 6,048.00 Land: 5,510 sq ft warranty deed

$ - Improvements: none
$  1,600.00 Damages: Cost to cure landscaping
$ 7,648.00 Total

Administrative Adjustment:
The property owner has a deed of trust with Quicken Loans, Inc., who require a title fee in the amount of

$125.00 and an application fee of $500.00 for a total of $625.00. The property owners have agreed to
convey property needed for the project if the above mentioned bank fees are paid.

Approval of an administrative adjustment is requested since the property owner incurred these expenses
to convey property needed for the proposed project,

Summary:
$ 7,648.00 Original Fair Market Value Offer

$ 625.00 Administrative Adjustment
$ 8,273.00 Total Compensation Amount

Approval:
It is our opinion the administrative adjustment is reasonable, prudent and in the interest of the Madison

County Board of Supervisors. The administratively adjusted amount was an expense required by the
property owner's lender, and is substantially lower than the overall cost to acquire this parcel eminent
domain proceedings. | have been authorized o approve an Increased offer amount of $625.00 to
acquire this parcel.

Gerald Steen, President of the Madison County Board of Supervisors
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From: Barry Zirulnik barryziruinik@att.net &
Subjfect: RE: Eminent Domaln Thomas

Date: November 2, 2020 at 9:59 AM
To: mrdye@me.com

Mark, here is Quicken Loans’ response. It looks ilike we need to requisition $625.00 at
this time ($125 for title work and $500 for application fee), subject to whether they decide
they need to order up their own appraisal ( beyond our summary provided to Quicken last
week) which is an additional fee. So please put in for the funding.

Barry 8. Zirulnik, Esg.

Price & Zirulnik, PLLC

750 Woodiands Parkway, Suite 205
Ridgeland, MS 39157

Phone: 601-353-3000

Fax: 601-353-3007

This message may contain confidential or proprietary information intended only for the
use of the addressee(s) named above or may contain information that is legally
privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, or the person responsible for delivering
it to the intended addressee, you are hereby notified that reading, disseminating,
distributing or copying this message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
message by mistake, please immediately notify us by replying to the message and delete
the original message and any copies immediately thereatfter,

From: Petersen, Charity <CharityPetersen@quickenloans.com=
Sent: Monday, November 2, 2020 8:48 AM

To: Barry Zirulnik <barryzirulnik@att.net>

Subject: RE: Eminent Domain Thomas

Hi Barry,

If an appraisal (full home and land) is required than the third party typically would have to
pay for that or we can order it on your behalf and you would pay us directly for it but we
will cross that bridge once | reach out to the investor. Also, if you ask us to record any
documents then the recording fee which is set by the county. But that would be it.

ggﬁ'@@{@?@ Charity Petersen

Senior Special Loans Underwriter

Loans | direct (313) 7828882

Fax: (844) 314-4305

love.protect.amaze.

A referral is the best compliment!
Refer your friends and family now.

From: Barry Zirulnik <barrvziruihik @at'tr.' ﬁeb
Sent: Monday, November 2, 2020 9:42 AM

Trr Datarcanm Charibv ~MharibvDatarcanAaninbanlanne name




